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Project Name  Lead Partner
Total Funding 

(Euro)

5

Legends as a tourism enforcing 
instrument in the region Kula-Zajecar-
Vidin Municipality of Kula 119 842,42

8

Cross-Border awareness raising activities 
on Management standards for enterprises 
- good practices for business 
development Association Horizonti (Sofia) 192 412,42

9
Exchange of good practices for quality 
management of municipal administrations

Agency for economic development 
Kostinbrod 147 932,63

14
Linking innovation with SME performance 
in Eastern Serbia and Northwest Bulgaria 

Regional Center for Sustainable 
Development and Entrepreneurship Timok 
Zajecar (Zajecar) 191 356,21

15 Regional Integration with a Social Effect Free Youth Centre (Vidin) 86 342,76

17

Network for cross-border co-operation 
between Bulgaria and Serbia in the tourist 
sector  

Chamber of Commerce and Industry Vratsa 
- Berkovitsa Branch 147 166,32

20
Cross-Border Music Academy "Music 
without Frontiers"

Bratstvo Community Centre 1869 
(Kyustendil) 87 340,21

22
FOR YOU - Family Online Resources and 
Youth Opportunity Units Viva Pautalia (Kyustendil) 83 301,05

25
Cross-Border Education Development 
Action Regional Chamber of Economy Zajecar 33 248,51

27

Zones of growth. Investment promotion of 
brown and green zones in the  Vidin, 
Zajechar and Bor regions

Vidin Chamber of Commerce and Industry 
(Vidin) 149 774,79

28

Model for cross-border cooperation in 
management of cultural-historical and 
natural heritage and development of 
sustainable tourism – Koprivshtitsa 
(Bulgaria) and Surdulica (Serbia)

Community Centre “H.N.Palaveev” 
(Koprivshtitsa) 177 559,64

31
South East European Network on Balkans 
- Cross border region BG-RS 

National Association of Small and Medium 
Business (NASMB) - Godech 181 172,61

32 Doing Business in the EU

Economic Association Regional Centre for 
the Development of Small and Medium 
Enterprises and Entrepreneurs – Nis 
Ltd.(Nis) 104 234,95

41

Green Ambassadors for Climate Change 
Prevention: Raising the awareness of 
young people on climate change and 
responsible environmental and civic 
behaviour

No Frontiers 21 Century Association 
(Kyustendil) 96 600,45

43

Increase the competitiveness of 
enterprises by focusing on technology and 
know-how transfer between SMEs, 
research, industry and educational 
institutions in the sphere of energy 
efficiency, renewable energy sources and 
ICT for the Sofia and Nishava distri GIS Transfer Center Foundation (Sofia) 138 323,79

46
Development for sustainable 
management and use of forests Regional Directorate of Forestry - Sofia 178 250,53

47 Beekeeping without Borders Bulgaria in Europe Association (Vidin) 143 740,40

53

Assessment of flood risk – a base for 
sustainable development in upper part of 
Nishava catchment

Scientific Research Department Sofia 
University "St. Kliment Ohridski" (Sofia) 191 856,84

55
Vocational e-learning program for cross-
border personnel development

Pernik Chamber of Commerce and Industry 
(Pernik) 85 920,53

65

Establishment of Information consultancy 
centers /ICC/ "Quick Start“ in the towns of 
Berkovica and Nis

National Association for Economic and 
Social Integration (Sofia) 156 999,17
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67

Publicity,Transparency and Partnership-a 
Basis for Social and Regional 
Development

Foundation for Transparent Regulations 
(Sofia) 161 821,71

69
Safe and healthy life through enhancing 
citizens responsibility towards pets Dai Lapa Association (Pernik) 64 465,30

75 United in the Struggle against Drugs EAST WEST Association (Vidin) 93 248,42

76 Youth Balkan Synthesis
Partners Kyustendil Association 
(Slokoshtitza - District of Kyustendil) 86 189,21

85
Energy efficiency in households – a long 
road or just a step away

Professor John Atanasov Foundation 
(Sofia) 187 018,37

87
Transboundary youth festival “Health and 
Friendship”

Secondary school "St. Cyril and Methodius" 
(Slivnitsa, District of Sofia) 91 953,71

89
Lets Share Our Future Developing 
Sustainable Tourism

Association European University of 
Hospitality and Tourism management 
(Sofia) 96 619,16

102
Culture and Balneology - a sustainable 
tourist product

Non Profit Making Organization "Local 
Initiative Group - Varshets" 51 798,60

103
Kraishte - Region of unique varieties of 
fruit crops University of Forestry (Sofia) 114 557,89

109

Network for the promotion and tourist 
exploitation of the cultural and natural 
heritage Municipality of Samokov 141 322,08

110 The Future Is In Our Hands
National Association "Legal Initiative for 
Local Government' - Montana Branch 176 672,44


